

Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021

Bid #21-7

Products	Unit Price at Plant	Unit Price Delivered District #1	Unit Price Delivered District #2	Unit Price Delivered District #3
Crushed Rock				
WASHED				
3/8" Limestone/Asphalt Chips				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	9.75 D1 / D3 Durapatch			
Quapaw	14.50 D2 & D3 Chip/Seal			
Apac-Central Inc	\$10.25	\$18.35	\$23.10	\$22.25
Anchor Stone Company	\$10.00	\$17.18	\$21.18	\$19.85
5/8" Limestone/Asphalt Chips				
Quapaw	\$14.50			
1/2" Limestone/Asphalt Chips				
Apac-Central Inc	\$10.25	\$18.35	\$23.10	\$22.25
Anchor Stone Company	\$10.00	\$17.18	\$21.18	\$19.85
3/4" Limestone/Asphalt Chips				
Quapaw	15.50 D2 & D3			
Apac-Central Inc	9.25 D1	\$17.35	\$22.10	\$21.25
Anchor Stone Company	\$10.00	\$17.18	\$21.18	\$19.85
Limestone/Asphalt Screenings				
Quapaw	9.00 D2 & D3			
Apac-Central Inc	5.00 D1	\$13.10	\$17.85	\$17.00
Anchor Stone Company	\$5.50	\$12.68	\$16.68	\$15.35
NOT WASHED				
3/8" Limestone/Asphalt Chips				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	9.75 D1			
Quapaw	14.50 D2 & D3			
Anchor Stone Company	\$10.00	\$17.18	\$21.18	\$19.85
5/8" Limestone/Asphalt Chips				
Quapaw	\$14.50			
1/2" Limestone/Asphalt Chips				
Anchor Stone Company	\$10.00	\$17.18	\$21.18	\$19.85
3/4" Limestone/Asphalt Chips				
Quapaw	15.50 D2 & D3			
Apac-Central Inc	9.25 D1	\$17.35	\$22.10	\$21.25
Anchor Stone Company	\$10.00	\$17.18	\$21.18	\$19.85
Limestone/Asphalt Screenings				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$5.50			
Quapaw	9.00 D2 & D3			
Apac-Central Inc	5.00 D1	\$13.10	\$17.85	\$17.00
Anchor Stone Company	\$5.50	\$12.68	\$16.65	\$15.35
Concrete Aggregates				
3/4" Class A				
Quapaw	15.50 D2 & D3			
Apac-Central Inc	9.25 D1	\$17.35	\$22.10	\$21.25
Anchor Stone Company	\$9.50	\$16.68	\$20.68	\$19.35
1" Concrete Aggregate				
Anchor Stone Company	\$9.25	\$16.43	\$20.43	\$19.10
1 1/2" Class A				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$9.50			
Quapaw	14.00 D2 & D3			
Apac-Central Inc	\$9.25	\$17.35	\$22.10	\$21.25
Anchor Stone Company	\$9.25	\$16.43	\$20.43	\$19.10
Crusher Run Materials				
3/4" Crusher Run				
Quapaw	13.00 D2 & D3			
Apac-Central Inc	\$6.75	\$14.85	\$19.60	\$18.75
Anchor Stone Company	\$6.25	\$13.43	\$17.43	\$16.10
1" Crusher Run				
Quapaw	\$13.00			

**Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021**

Bid #21-7

1 1/2" Crusher Run				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$6.50			
Quapaw	8.25 D2 & D3			
Apac-Central Inc	\$6.75	\$14.85	\$19.60	\$18.75
Anchor Stone Company	\$6.25	\$13.43	\$17.43	\$16.10
3" Crusher Run				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$6.50			
Quapaw	\$10.75			
Apac-Central Inc	\$6.75	\$14.85	\$19.60	\$18.75
Anchor Stone Company	\$6.50	\$13.68	\$17.68	\$16.35
1 1/2" Road Rock				
Quapaw	11.25 D2			
Anchor Stone Company	9.50 D1 & D3	\$16.68	\$20.68	\$19.35
1" Marble or Asphalt Chips				
Anchor Stone Company	\$9.50	\$16.68	\$20.68	\$19.35
1 1/2" Marble or Asphalt Chips				
Apac-Central Inc	\$9.00	\$17.10	\$21.85	\$21.00
Anchor Stone Company	\$9.50	\$16.68	\$20.68	\$19.35
(Quarry) Run Rip Rap				
Anchor Stone Company	\$9.50	\$22.07	\$29.07	\$26.74
3"- 6" Rip Rap				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	10.50 D1			
Quapaw	12.00 D2 & 3			
Anchor Stone Company	\$17.00	\$29.57	\$36.57	\$34.24
7"- 10" Rip Rap				
Anchor Stone Company	\$17.00	\$29.57	\$36.57	\$34.24
12" Rip Rap				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$18.50			
Apac-Central Inc	\$19.00	\$28.10	\$32.85	\$32.00
Anchor Stone Company	\$17.00	\$29.57	\$36.57	\$34.24
18" Rip Rap				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$18.50			
Apac-Central Inc	\$19.00	\$28.10	\$32.85	\$32.00
Anchor Stone Company	\$17.00	\$29.57	\$36.57	\$34.24
Parking Lot Special				
(Mixture of Crusher Run 1" - 3")				
Quapaw	\$7.00			
AG Lime 55% ECCE				
(Effective Calcium Carbonate Equivalent)				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$6.50			
Quapaw	\$2.50			
T B S C Type A - 5/8"				
(Meets state specifications. Material is a cleaner crusher run less fines. Used as a surface material)				
Quapaw	13.00 D2 & D3			
Anchor Stone Company	7.00 D1	\$14.18	\$18.18	\$16.85
T B S C Type E- 1 1/2"				
(Meets state specifications. Material is a cleaner crusher run less fines. Used as a surface material)				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$6.75			
Quapaw	12.00 D2 & 3			
Apac-Central Inc	\$7.00	\$15.10	\$19.85	\$19.00
Anchor Stone Company	7.00 D1	\$14.18	\$18.18	\$16.85
S A B M Type A - 1 1/2"				
(Meets state specifications used as a road base material)				
Quapaw	12.00 D2 & 3			
Anchor Stone Company	7.00 D1	\$14.18	\$18.18	\$16.85

Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021

Bid #21-7

S A B M Type E - 1 1/2"				
(Meets state specifications used as a road base material)				
Anchor Stone Company	\$7.00	\$14.18	\$18.18	\$16.85
Surge Rock				
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$9.50			
Quapaw	12.00 D2 & 3			
Apac-Central Inc	9.00 D1	\$17.10	\$21.85	\$21.00
Anchor Stone Company	\$9.50	\$22.07	\$29.07	\$26.74
Sand (Screened)				
Anchor Stone Company	\$7.00	\$12.68	\$16.85	NB
Asphaltic Materials				
Non-spec Scrap Asphalt/Millings				
Tulsa Asphalt	\$13.00	\$21.00	\$26.00	\$25.00
Sherwood Construction/Greenhill Materials	\$15.00			
Non-spec Concrete (Waste)				
Concrete				
3000 PSI per yard				
Dolese Brothers	\$99.00	\$99.00	NO BID	NO BID
3500 PSI per yard				
Dolese Brothers	\$102.00	\$102.00	NO BID	NO BID
4000 PSI per yard				
Dolese Brothers	\$105.00	\$105.00	NO BID	NO BID
CGM Culvert Pipe - Round		16 guage Unit Price	14 guage Unit Price	Bands Unit Price
18"				
Dub Ross		\$11.73	\$14.83	\$17.60
Fensco		\$13.93	NB	\$21.00
24"				
Dub Ross		\$15.38	\$19.65	\$23.07
Fensco		\$18.29	NB	\$27.50
30"				
Dub Ross		\$19.30	\$24.44	\$28.95
Fensco		\$22.17	NB	\$33.25
36"				
Dub Ross		\$23.00	\$29.27	\$34.50
Fensco		\$27.88	NB	\$42.00
42"				
Dub Ross		\$26.82	\$34.08	\$40.23
Fensco		\$33.47	NB	\$50.50
48"				
Dub Ross		\$35.50	\$38.89	\$71.00
Fensco		\$37.56	NB	\$57.00
60"				
Dub Ross		\$44.06	\$55.62	\$88.12
Fensco		\$52.90	NB	\$80.00
72"				
Dub Ross		\$53.00	\$66.56	\$106.00
Fensco		\$64.20	NB	\$128.40
84"				
Dub Ross		\$61.40	\$77.50	\$122.80
Fensco		NB	\$79.06	\$158.15
96"				
Dub Ross		NB	\$88.45	\$176.90
Fensco		NB	\$91.86	\$183.75

**Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021**

Bid #21-7

CGM Culvert Pipe - Flat		16 guage Unit Price	14 guage Unit Price	Bands Unit Price	
18"					
Dub Ross		\$12.43	\$15.71	\$18.64	
Fensco		\$15.26	NB	\$23.00	
24"					
Dub Ross		\$16.30	\$20.63	\$24.45	
Fensco		\$20.56	NB	\$31.00	
30"					
Dub Ross		\$20.27	\$25.66	\$30.41	
Fensco		\$26.33	NB	\$40.00	
36"					
Dub Ross		NB	\$30.70	\$46.05	
Fensco		NB	\$38.56	\$58.00	
42"					
Dub Ross		NB	\$35.78	\$53.67	
Fensco		NB	\$45.90	\$70.00	
48"					
Dub Ross		NB	\$46.90	\$93.80	
Fensco		NB	\$60.19	\$93.00	
60"					
Dub Ross		NB	\$58.40	\$116.80	
Fensco		NB	\$71.70	\$113.00	
3" X 1" Corrugated Steel Pipe- Round		16 guage Unit Price	14 guage Unit Price	Bands Unit Price	
36"					
Dub Ross		27.91	NB	55.82	
48"					
Dub Ross		36.97	46.17	92.34	
60"					
Dub Ross		46.00	57.47	114.94	
Fensco		52.90	63.25	\$80.00	
New Or Used Steel Pipe		Gauge	Unit	Unit Price Used	Unit Price New
2 3/8"					
Sunbelt		3/16		\$1.25	
4"					
Sunbelt		1/4		\$4.25	
6"					
Sunbelt		1/4		\$6.25	
7"					
NB					
8 5/8"					
Sunbelt		5/16		\$10.00	
9 3/8"					
The Railroad Yard		0.395	FT	\$14.95	\$13.95
10"					
Sunbelt		1/4		\$10.00	
16"					
The Railroad Yard		0.250	FT	\$19.45	NB
18" X 1/4" (OR Heavier)					
The Railroad Yard		0.250	FT	\$25.00	NB
Sunbelt		1/4		\$24.00	
20"					
The Railroad Yard		0.250	FT	28.50 D1	\$28.50
Sunbelt		1/4		28.50 D2 & D3	
24"					
The Railroad Yard		0.250	FT	\$31.75	\$31.75
Sunbelt		5/16		\$27.50	

**Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021**

Bid #21-7

26"				
NB				
30"				
The Railroad Yard	.250+	FT	\$47.00	NB
Sunbelt	3/8		\$48.00	
36"				
The Railroad Yard	0.312	FT	\$55.00	NB
Sunbelt	3/8		\$53.50	
41"				
The Railroad Yard	.312+	FT	\$58.50	NB
Sunbelt	3/8		\$59.00	
42"				
The Railroad Yard	0.250	FT	\$97.50	\$97.50
Sunbelt	5/16		\$98.00	
48"				
The Railroad Yard	0.250	FT	\$109.00	\$109.00
Sunbelt	1/4		\$105.00	
54"				
The Railroad Yard	0.312	FT	\$155.00	\$155.00
60"				
The Railroad Yard	0.312	FT	\$173.00	\$173.00
Sunbelt	3/8		\$158.50	
66"				
The Railroad Yard	0.312	FT	\$190.00	\$190.00
72"				
The Railroad Yard	0.312	FT	\$207.00	\$207.00
Sunbelt	3/8		\$199.00	
84"				
The Railroad Yard	0.312	FT	\$242.00	\$242.00
Sunbelt	3/8		\$234.00	
94"				
NB				
96"				
The Railroad Yard	0.438	FT	\$235.00	\$235.00
102"				
The Railroad Yard	0.438	FT	\$235.00	\$235.00
108"				
The Railroad Yard	0.438	FT	\$235.00	\$235.00
114"				
The Railroad Yard	0.438	FT	\$235.00	\$235.00
120"				
The Railroad Yard	0.438	FT	\$235.00	\$235.00
Used railroad half tank car culverts with steel floor & head walls. 8'-9'				
The Railroad Yard	0.438	FT	\$245.00	\$245.00
Corrugated Polypropylene Pipe		Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price Couplers
AASHTO 330 HIGHWAY SPECIFICATION				
20' & 13' LENGTHS AVAILABLE- ALL PIPE WATERTIGHT				
12 "				
Dub Ross		ft	\$6.90	\$6.90
Fensco			\$6.40	\$10.00
15"				
Dub Ross		ft	\$10.40	\$10.40
Fensco			\$9.45	\$16.50
18"				
Dub Ross		ft	\$12.83	\$12.83
Fensco			\$11.99	\$26.50
21"	No longer made by ADS			

**Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021**

Bid #21-7

24"				
Dub Ross		ft	\$20.69	\$20.69
Fensco			\$19.99	\$36.00
30"				
Dub Ross		ft	\$33.15	\$33.15
Fensco			\$31.28	\$88.00
36"				
Dub Ross		ft	\$37.61	37.61 D1
Fensco			\$34.97	118.80 D2 & d3
42"				
Dub Ross		ft	\$45.80	91.60 D1
Fensco			\$43.78	175.00 D2 & D3
48"				
Dub Ross		ft	\$62.30	124.60 D1
Fensco			\$59.60	225.00 D2 & D3
60"				
Dub Ross		ft	\$89.50	179.00 D1
Fensco			\$83.25	325.00 D2 & D3
Dual wall polypropylene pipe is AASHTO (highway) rated				
under spec M330 for use under roadway applications capable of				
H-25 traffic loads (per manufactures recommended installation procedures).				
Corrugated High Density Polyethylene Pipe				
AASHTO M252/M294 HIGHWAY SPECIFICATION		Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price
10', 20', 24' OR 30' LENGTHS AVAILABLE-				Couplers
ALL PIPE WATERTIGHT				
4"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$0.86	\$0.86
Fensco			0.96 D3	3.50 D3
Dub Ross		ft	0.83 D1 & D2	0.83 D1 & D2
8"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$2.86	2.86 D1
Fensco			\$1.96	6.50 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$2.70	\$2.70
10"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$4.28	\$4.28
Fensco			\$3.98	9.75 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$4.00	4.00 D1
12"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$5.70	\$5.70
Fensco			\$5.20	10.00 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$5.60	5.60 D1
15"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$8.02	\$8.02
Fensco			\$7.31	16.50 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$7.88	7.88 D1
18"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$10.76	\$10.76
Fensco			\$9.82	26.50 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$10.59	10.59 D1
24"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$17.87	\$17.87
Fensco			\$16.00	36.00 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$17.50	17.50 D1
30"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$25.59	\$25.59
Fensco			\$23.15	88.00 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$25.10	25.10 D1

Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021

Bid #21-7

36"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$34.31	\$68.62
Fensco			\$30.32	118.80 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$33.78	33.78 D1
42"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$42.81	\$85.62
Fensco			\$37.64	175.00 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$84.32	84.32 D1
48"				
DP Supply Company		LF	\$56.39	\$112.78
Fensco			\$49.82	225.00 D2 & D3
Dub Ross		ft	\$111.00	111.00 D1
60"				
DP Supply Company	5 day lead time	LF	\$81.65	163.30 D1
Fensco	1 day lead time		\$76.01	325.00 D2 & D3
Dub Ross	3 day lead time	ft	\$172.74	\$172.74
Delivery lead time to jobsite or County barn _____ Days				
Dual wall HDPE pipe to be AASHTO (highway) rated M294 or				
M252 for use under roadway applications capable of				
H-25 traffic loads (per manufactures recommended installation procedures).				
New Structural Steel		Unit	Unit Price	
I-Beams				
Sunbelt		#	\$0.56	NB
H-Beams				
Sunbelt		#	\$0.49	NB
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$0.4945	\$0.35
Wide flange beam				
Sunbelt		#	\$0.49	NB
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$0.5150	\$0.3145
Channels				
Sunbelt		#	\$0.49	NB
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$0.4975	\$0.35
Angles				
Sunbelt		#	\$0.49	NB
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$0.4975	\$0.35
Stay in Place Forms				
Sunbelt		sq ft	\$1.32	NB
22 Gauge Decking				
Sunbelt		sq ft	\$1.33	NB
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$1.33	NB
10 Gauge black interlocking sheeting				
Sunbelt		sq ft	\$5.08	NB
10 gauge galvanized sheeting				
Sunbelt		sq ft	\$5.59	NB
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$5.53	NB
Used Structural Steel		Unit	Unit Price	
(WF) I-Beams				
Sunbelt		#	\$0.31	NB
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$0.3145	NB
H-Beams				
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$0.35	NB
Channels				
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$0.35	NB
Angles				
The Railroad Yard		lb	\$0.35	NB

**Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021**

Bid #21-7

Reinforcing Steel		Unit	Unit Price		
1/2"					
Sunbelt		ft	\$0.28	NB	
The Railroad Yard		ft	\$0.27	NB	
5/8"					
Sunbelt		ft	\$0.44	NB	
The Railroad Yard		ft	\$0.4250	NB	
Treated Lumber	CCA	ACZA	CREOSOTE	PENTA	
FIR					
3 X 12 8' - 16'	NB	NB	NB	NB	
3 X 12 18' - 20'	NB	NB	NB	NB	
3 X 12 22' - 26'	NB	NB	NB	NB	
PINE					
3 X 12 8' - 16'					
Leo Hicks Creosoting	\$1600.00 per M	NB	\$1900.00 per M	NB	
3 X 12 18' - 20'					
Leo Hicks Creosoting	\$1650.00 per M	NB	\$1925.00 per M	NB	
3 X 12 22' - 24'					
Leo Hicks Creosoting	\$1850.00 per M	NB	\$2150.00 per M	NB	
High carbon steel, Hardened hardness rating-min. Rc 43 (BR 400) Blades must be heat treated & guaranteed against breakage.					
Grader Blades		Bolt Hole	Unit	Unit Price	Part Number
1/2" X 6" X 72"					
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$44.88	8D2786	
1/2" X 6" X 84"					
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$53.33	8D2787	
1/2" X 6" X 96"					
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$59.83	9J7782	
1/2" X 8" X 72"					
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$62.47	8D2788	
1/2" X 8" X 84"					
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$72.84	8D2789	
1/2" X 8" X 96"					
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$83.26	8J8980	
5/8" X 6" X 72"					
Dub Ross	5/8 or 3/4	ft	\$9.63 lf		
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$52.77	5D9553	
5/8" X 6" X 84"					
Kirby Smith			\$70.85	5/8x6x7 MT	
Dub Ross	5/8 or 3/4	ft	\$9.63 lf		
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$61.56	5D9554	
5/8" X 6" X 96"					
Dub Ross	5/8 or 3/4	ft	\$9.63 lf		
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$70.35	8J4043	
5/8" X 8" X 72"					
Dub Ross	5/8 or 3/4	ft	\$13.13 lf		
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$73.44	5D9562	
5/8" X 8" X 84"					
Kirby Smith			\$99.72	5/8x8x7 MT	
Dub Ross	5/8 or 3/4	ft	\$13.13 lf		
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$85.69	5D9561	
5/8" X 8" X 96"					
Kirby Smith			\$103.79	5/8X8X8 MT	
Dub Ross	5/8 or 3/4	ft	\$13.13 lf		
Wear Parts & Equipment	5/8"	each	\$97.93	5D9731	

Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021

Bid #21-7

Nails		Unit	Unit Price	
60D Ring Shank		NB		
Band Bolts		Unit	Unit Price	
1/2" X 6"		NB		
1/2" X 8"				
Dub Ross		ea w/ bolt	\$1.60	
Blade Bolts		Unit	Unit Price	
5/8" X 2"				
Dub Ross		ea w/ nut	\$0.75	
Wear Parts & Equipment		Box of 180	\$108.00	
5/8" X 2 1/2"				
Dub Ross		ea w/ nut	\$0.85	
Wear Parts & Equipment		Box of 150	100.50	
5/8" X 3"				
Dub Ross		ea w/ nut	\$0.95	
Wear Parts & Equipment		Box of 120	\$96.00	
Hauling		District 1	District 2	District 3
Per ton mile		NB	NB	NB
Hourly Rate- Bobtail				
Dunham's Asphalt Services		\$100.00		
Hourly rate- End dump trailer				
Dunham's Asphalt Services		\$100.00		
Smithey Environmental Services		\$95.00	\$95.00	\$95.00
Minimum load		Tons		
Dunham's Asphalt Services		15 Tons		
Fuel price basis per gallon				
Smithey Environmental Services		\$2.00		
NOTE: TO ALLOW FUTURE FUEL COST ADJUSTMENTS (SURCHARGE) IN THE EVENT OF INCREASE IN FUEL				
PRICE THE VENDOR SHALL ESTABLISH A BASIS FOR FUEL PRICE IN THE BID.				
BID MUST BE WITH NO RESTRICTIONS ON DESTINATION OR LOCATION OF QUARRY				
Sign post	Unit Price	Unit		COMMENTS
Material finish- pre-galvanized with a conversion coating & a clear organic polymer top coat.				
Tubing shall be perforated on all 4 sides with 7/16" pre-punched holes on 1" centers.				
Tubing shall allow for telescoping within each other.				
1 3/4" X 1 3/4" Square Tube - 14 guage				
Xcessories Squared Development & MFG	\$2.32	LF		30 Day lead time / SW0761
Advanced Workzone Services	\$4.25	LF		
The Railroad Yard	\$2.25	FT		
2" X 2" Square Tube -12 guage				
Xcessories Squared Development & MFG	\$3.79	LF		
Advanced Workzone Services	\$4.40	LF		
The Railroad Yard	\$2.45	FT		
Tamper resistant drive rivet 7/16"				
Xcessories Squared Development & MFG	\$0.60	EA		
Advanced Workzone Services	\$1.75	LF		
Curve Bolt 5/16" S.A.E.				
Xcessories Squared Development & MFG	\$0.42	EA		
Advanced Workzone Services	\$2.00	LF		
Teflon Flat Washer 3/8" Screw Size I.D. 406 O.D. 1.000 Thickness .062				
Xcessories Squared Development & MFG	\$0.10	EA		
Advanced Workzone Services	\$0.50	EA		
Hex Nut 5/16" S.A.E.				
Xcessories Squared Development & MFG	\$0.09	EA		
Advanced Workzone Services	\$0.50	EA		
Drive rivet 3/8" size with 1/4" drive 1" length				
Xcessories Squared Development & MFG	\$0.60	EA		
Advanced Workzone Services	\$1.50	EA		

Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021

Bid #21-7

Pot Hole Patching Materials-				
material shall be plant mixed, high performance pavement patching material, approved mineral aggregates, modified bituminous blend & polymer modified cold asphalt. Permanent asphalt repair shall be uniform, remain flexible & cohesive to -15 degrees & shall be capable of storage in an uncovered outdoor stockpile for a minimum of two years.				
A) The aggregate shall consist of 100% crushed limestone or a laboratory approved equivalent under ASTM C-136.				
B) The modified bituminous liquid blend shall meet the following:				
ASTM D-1310 Flashpoint (TOC) 200 F. (94 C.) minimum				
ASTM D-2170 Kinematic viscosity at 60 c (140 F) 300-4000				
ASTM D-96 Water maximum				
ASTM D-402 Distillate test (volume of original sample)				
Cold Patch Asphalt	Unit Price at Plant	Unit Price Delivered District #1	Unit Price Delivered District #2	Unit Price Delivered District #3
Logan County Asphalt - Proline	\$99.75 / ton	\$112.00 / ton	\$112.00 / ton	\$112.00 / ton
Logan County Asphalt - Proline	\$9.50 / 50 lb bag	\$11.50 / 50 lb bag	\$11.50 / 50 lb bag	\$11.50 / 50 lb bag
Dunham's Asphalt Services - QPR	\$90.00	\$96.60	\$106.20	\$101.00
Asphalt Produces Inc	\$95.00	\$112.00	\$112.00	\$112.00
T&C Asphalt Materials	\$9.00 per 60 # bag	\$10.00 per 60 # bag	\$10.00 per 60 # bag	\$10.00 per 60 # bag
Asphalt	Plant unit price	Delivered unit price District #1	Delivered unit price District #2	Delivered unit price District #3
Hot Mix/Hot Lay, Type B				
Dunham's Asphalt Services	\$43.50	\$50.10	\$59.70	\$54.50
Tulsa Asphalt	\$46.00	\$54.00	\$59.00	\$58.00
Hot Mix/Hot Lay, Type C				
Dunham's Asphalt Services	\$46.50	\$53.10	\$62.70	\$57.50
Tulsa Asphalt	\$48.00	\$56.00	\$61.00	\$60.00
Hot Mix/Hot Lay, Type A				
Dunham's Asphalt Services	\$42.00	\$48.60	\$58.20	\$53.00
Tulsa Asphalt	\$42.00	\$50.00	\$55.00	\$54.00
Hot Mix/Cold Lay				
Dunham's Asphalt Services	\$90.00	\$96.60	\$106.20	\$101.00
Tulsa Asphalt	\$89.00	\$97.00	\$102.00	\$101.00

Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021

Bid #21-7

Asphaltic Oil & Emulsion	Plant unit price	Delivered unit price Districts 1, 2 & 3	Pump & Demurrage charge	Minimum load short freight charge
AC-7.5				
Asphalt & Fuel Supply	\$1.65	\$1.75		
MC-30				
Coastal Energy Corp- Clinton, OK	\$2.04	\$2.10	\$75.00 pump & \$75.00 per hr 1st 2 hrs free	5,500 gallons / \$475.00 sfc
Asphalt & Fuel Supply	\$1.70	\$1.80	\$75.00 pump & \$75.00 per hr 1st 2 hrs free	5,500 gallons /.10 per gallon
MC-70				
Coastal Energy Corp- Clinton, OK	\$2.01	\$2.07		
Asphalt & Fuel Supply	\$1.72	\$1.82		
MC-250				
Coastal Energy Corp- Clinton, OK	\$1.94	\$2.00		
Asphalt & Fuel Supply	\$1.73	\$1.83		
MC-800				
Coastal Energy Corp- Clinton, OK	\$1.89	\$1.95		
Asphalt & Fuel Supply	\$1.71	\$1.81		
MC-3000				
Coastal Energy Corp- Clinton, OK	\$1.84	\$1.90		
Asphalt & Fuel Supply	\$1.70	\$1.80		
MAC-400				
Asphalt & Fuel Supply	\$1.80	\$1.90		
SS-1				
Coastal Energy Corp- Miller, MO	1.88 D1 & D2	\$1.94	\$75.00 pump & \$75.00 per hr 1st 2 hrs free	5,500 gallons / \$475.00 sfc
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions	1.95 D3	\$2.00	\$70.00 pump & \$70.00 per hr 1st 2 hrs free	Additional min freight fee added to loads less than 5,600 gal/ Environmental fee \$.49770/ton for asphalt & polymer loads or .00150/gal for emulsion will be added to prices
Vance Brothers	\$2.10	\$2.00	75.00 pump / 70.00 demurrage	5,500 gallons/ upcharge \$550.00
CRS-2				
Coastal Energy Corp- Miller, MO	\$1.83	\$1.89		
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions	\$1.70	\$1.75		
Wright Asphalt	\$1.65	\$1.68	\$75.00 pump & \$75.00 per hr 1st 2 hrs free	5,500 gallons /.10 per gallon
Vance Brothers	\$2.00	\$1.90		
CRS-TR				
Wright Asphalt (Equivalent to CRS-2)	\$1.89	\$1.94	\$75.00 pump & \$75.00 per hr 1st 2 hrs free	5,500 gallons /.10 per gallon
CRS-2+				
Coastal Energy Corp- Miller, MO	\$1.93	\$1.99		
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions	1.80 D1 & D3	\$1.85		
Wright Asphalt	1.78 D2	\$1.81		
Vance Brothers	\$2.20	\$2.10		
CQS-1F				
Coastal Energy Corp- Miller, MO	\$1.90	\$1.96		
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions	\$1.75	\$1.80		
Wright Asphalt- TR-FOG	\$1.83	\$1.85		
AE-P				
Coastal Energy Corp- Miller, MO	2.25 D1 & D2	\$2.31		
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions	2.30 D3	\$2.35		
Vance Brothers	\$2.45	\$2.35		
* Asphaltic Oil Measurement of all liquid asphalt shall be in U.S. gallons corrected to 60 degrees Fahrenheit using ASTM D-1250 for asphalt.				
**Asphaltic Oil & Emulsion must be available in quantities as small as 500 gallons.				

Creek County
6 Month Bridge and Highway Materials
and Professional Services
Bid Results
Effective January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021

Bid #21-7

SERVICE				
Dozer Work				
D-4 Dozer (or comparable)				
T-D-15 (or comparable)				
D-9 (or comparable)				
1150 with winch				
850				
550				
Other				
Trackhoe Work				
20 Ton				
CAT 336				
Pile Driving				
Crane Service				
Motor Grader Work				
Backhoe Service				
Concrete Finishing				
Turn key				
Set up				
Pour				
Finish				
Road Stripping Service				
Advanced Workzone Services		.15 per 4" LF		
Asphalt Overlay				
Turn key-product, haul, laydown, signage, blocking & barricading				
Dunham's Asphalt Services				
Unit/Price	District #1	\$61.00		
Trip Charge	District #1	\$1,500.00		
Unit/Price	District #2	\$60.50		
Trip Charge	District #2	\$1,500.00		
Unit/Price	District #3	\$66.50		
Trip Charge	District #3	\$1,500.00		
Bridge Beam Transportation				